
ITB No.: 15-062R

The School Board of Broward County, Florida 
Procurement & Warehousing Services 

Tentative Board Meeting Date*: DECEMBER 9, 2014 

Description: NEW TIRES TERM CONTRACT 
---------.;..;;..'-"-'"'""''"--------

Notified: _____ 1_3 ___ _ Downloaded 7

ITB Rec'd: 

1TB Opening: 

3 No Bids: ___ 0 __ _ 

For: VEHICLE MAINTENANCE 

Fund: DEPARTMENT'S OPERATING BUDGET 

OCTOBER 2, 2014 

Advertised Date: SEPTEMBER 19, 2014 

Award Amount: $2,600,000.00 (PERCONTRACT PERIOD) 

POSTING OF 1TB RECOMMENDATIONfl'ABULATION; 1TB Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in Procurement & 
Warehousing Services and www.Dernandstar.com on OCTOBER 7, 201ll@ 3:00 PM , and will remain posted for 72 hours. Any person 

who is adversely affected by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 hours after the posting. of the notice of 
decision or intended decision. The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) days after the date the notice of protest is filed. Failure to file a 
notice of protest or failure to file a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under this chapter. Section 120.57(3)(b ), Florida Statutes, 
states that "The formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based." Saturdays, Sundays, state holidays 
and days during which the school district administration is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period provided. Filings shall 
be at the office of the Director of Procurement & Warehousing Services, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. Any 
person who files an action protesting an intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond, pa){al>le 
to The School B!)al'd of Broward County, Florida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (1 % ) of the estimated value of the contract. Failure to post 
the bond required by SBBC Policy 3320, Part vm, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of 
the right to protest. 

(*) The Cone of Silence, as stated in the 1TB, is in effect until this bid is approved by SBBC. The School Board meeting date stated 
above is a tentative date. Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of record for the actual date the Cone of Silence has concluded. 

AWARDEE 

EARL W. COLVARD, INC. 
d/b/a BOULEY ARD TIRE CENTER 

CALLAGHAN TIRE 

TIRESO� OF BROWARD, INC.· 

RECOMMENDATIONlfABULATION 
ITEM (S) AWARDED 

PRIMARY 

FIRST ALTERNATE 

SECOND ALTERNATE 

IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE THREE PROPOSERS. THE IDGHEST RANKED PROPOSER SHALL 
BE THE PRIMARY VENDOR. THE SECOND lilGHEST RANKED PROPOSER SHALL BE THE FIRST AL TERNA TE VENDOR AND THE TlilRD 
lilGHEST RANKED PROPOSER SHALL BE THE SECOND ALTERNATE VENDOR. THE PRIMARY VENDOR SHOULD RECEIVE THE 
LARGEST VOLUME OF WORK. IF THE PRIMARY VENDOR IS UNABLE TO COMPLY WITH THE WORK REQUIREMENTS, 
SPECIFICATIONS, AND EMERGENCIES OR IF IT IS IN THE BEST INTEREST OF SBBC, THE FIRST AND SECOND ALTERNATE VENDORS 
MAY BE UTILIZED RESPECTIVELY. 

BID ITEMS,7,9,15,19,20,71,72,80,85,87: IN ACCORDANCE WITH GENERAL CONDITION 6, ITEMS WILL NOT BE REBID. ITEMS WILL BE 
PURCHASED ACCORDING TO STANDARD PURCHASING PROCEDURES. 

CONTRACT PERIOD: DECEMBER 10, 2014 TIIROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2017 OR AS AMENDED. 

By: � ·__..,....,..� Date: 
---------;

(Purc
rn::::i

has
�in::g;-:Atg::

en
;:;t�*=::::::---------

10/06/14 

The School Boa!d of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any poll which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression, 
national origin, marital status. race, religion, sex or sexual orientation. duals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO 

Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TI'Y) at 754-321-2158. 

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities 
(EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TI'Y) at 754-321-2158. 

REVISED: 2/13/14 
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Bid No. 15-062R Bid Title: New Tires Bid Opened: October 2, 2014 

Purchasing Agent: Brian Long 

0
THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA 

'ii' Earl W. Colvard, Inc. d/b/a Boulevard Tire Center, Deland, 
BID TABULATION SHEET Florida Callahan Tire, Riviera Beach, FL 

1:11u umt 1:11u Pnce 0'7o Pret. net. t"nce cna unit i:11a Price :>7o Pret. Pret. nice 

Item A Description Quantity Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Price Extension Unit Price Extension 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 255/70R22.5 H 
1 G661HSA 2,716 each $236.74 $ 642,985.84 $241.24 $ 655,207.84 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 195/70R14 
2 Conauest 5 each $69.68 $ 348.40 $70.68 $ 353.40 
3 Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 195/65R15 12 each $68.87 $ 826.44 $69.87 $ 838.44 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 225/50R17 
4 Eaale RSA 96 each $103.91 $ 9,975.36 $102.91 $ 9,879.36 
5 Bridaestone/Firestone: Tire, New 215/75R15P 3 each $82.71 $ 248.13 $84.71 $ 254.13 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 27-950 X 15 
6 Tractor 12 each $206.06 $ 2,472.72 $206.06 $ 2,472.72 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 8-14.5 BIAS 
7 (11/32) 70 each *REMOVED *REMOVED * REMOVED * REMOVED

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 225/60R-16 
8 LOADV 30 each $90.31 $ 2,709.30 $92.31 $ 2,769.30 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 1 OOOX20 BIAS-
9 Trailers 8 each *REMOVED * REMOVED *REMOVED * REMOVED

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New P235-70R16 
10 WRLSR-A OWL 200 each $101.34 $ 20,268.00 $102.34 $ 20,468.00 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New P205/75R14 
11 (10/32) 12 each $74.68 $ 896.16 $61.70 $ 740.40 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 8R19.5 (14/32) 
12 G647 500 each $184.56 $ 92,280.00 $184.56 $ 92,280.00 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New L T245/75R16 
13 (14/32) WRL H T  800 each $108.61 $ 86,888.00 $110.11 $ 88,088.00 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 215 60R 16 
14 Assurance 600 each $84.99 $ 50,994.00 $85.99 $ 51,594.00 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 100R15, Radia; 
15 16/32 12 each *REMOVED * REMOVED * REMOVED * REMOVED

16 Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New LT425/75R-17E 325 each $119.62 $ 38,876.50 $121.12 $ 39,364.00 
17 Bridaestone/Firestone: Tire, New 245/7 20 each $237.84 $ 4;756.80 $241.84 $ 4,836.80 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, 235/55R17 
18 Police 20 each $103.38 $ 2,067.60 $105.38 $ 2,107.60 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, P205/75R15 
19 110/32} 5 each *REMOVED *REMOVED * REMOVED * REMOVED 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, 205-75-15 
20 Trailer 170 each *REMOVED *REMOVED * REMOVED * REMOVED

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, 225/75R15 
21 (11/32) 60 each $87.83 $ 5,269.80 $89.83 $ 5,389.80 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, S T225/75R15 
22 Trailer 80 each * REMOVED * REMOVED *REMOVED * REMOVED

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, LT235/75R15 
23 112/32) 12 each $102.17 $ 1,226.04 $103.67 $ 1,244.04 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, LT235/85R16 
24 '14/32) 100 each $113.30 $ 11,330.00 $114.80 $ 11,480.00 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, LT215/85R16 
25 (13/32) 400 each $102.02 $ 40,808.00 $103.52 $ 41,408.00 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, 10R22.5 G 
26 G661 HAS 2,250 each $283.06 $ 636,885.00 $290.06 $ 652,635.00 
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Bid No. 15-062R Bid Title: New Tires Bid Opened: October 2, 2014 

Purchasing Agent: Brian Long 

"!:C THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA 

gf.li 
Earl W. Colvard, Inc. d/b/a Boulevard Tire Center, Deland, 

BID TABULATION SHEET Florida Callahan Tire, Riviera Beach, FL 
c,lu umt c,lu l"'rice <no l"'rer. l"'rer. l"'rice 1:110 Umt cna Price :>7o Pref. Pref. Price 

Item A Description Quantity Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Price Extension Unit Price Extension 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 11 R22.5 G 
27 G661 HAS 3,850 each $259.45 $ 998,882.50 $261.95 $ 1,008,507.50 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, L T225/75R 16E 
28 1(13/32) 2,700 each $109.53 $ 295,731.00 $111.53 $ 301,131.00 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, P255-70R16 
29 (12/32) 12 each $112.11 $ 1,345.32 $114.11 $ 1,369.32 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, 275/70R-22.5 
30 (275-80R) 22 each $257.51 $ 5,665.22 $262.51 $ 5,775.22 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, 225/?0R-15 FD 
31 Ranger 50 each $96.27 $ 4,813.50 $98.27 $ 4,913.50 
32 Bridaestone/Firestone: Tire, New, 245/65R17 65 each $85.98 $ 5,588.70 $87.98 $ 5,718.70 

TOTAL- BRIDGESTONE/FIRESTONE $ 2,964,138.33 $ 3,010,826.07 

33 Goodyear Tire, New, 255/70R22.5 H G661 HSA 2,716 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
34 Goodyear Tire, New, 195/70R 14 Conquest 5 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
35 Goodyear Tire, New, 195-65R15 12 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID 
36 Goodyear Tire, New, 225/50R17 Eagle RSA 96 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
37 Goodyear Tire, New, 215/75R15P 3 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
38 Goodyear Tire, New, 27-950 X15 Tractor 12 each NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID 
39 Goodyear Tire, New, 8-.14.5 BIAS (11/32) 70 each NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID 
40 Goodyear Tire, New, 225/60R-16 LOAD V 30 each NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID 
41 DELETE NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
42 Goodyear Tire, New, 1000X20 BIAS-Trailers 8 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID 

Goodyear Tire, New, P235-70R16 WRL SR-A 
43 OWL 200 each NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID 
44 Goodyear Tire, New, P205/75R14 (10/32\ 12 each NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID 
45 Goodyear Tire, New, 8R19.5 (14-32) G647 500 each NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Goodyear Tire, New, LT245/75R16 (14/32) WRI 
46 HT 800 each NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
47 Goodyear Tire, New, 215-60R 16 Assurance 600 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
48 Goodyear Tire, New, 1000R15, Radial 16/32 12 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID 
49 Goodyear Tire, New, LT425/75R-17E 325 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
50 Goodyear Tire, New, 245/70R 19.5 G159 20 each NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID 
51 Goodyear Tire, New, 235/55R17 Police 20 each NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID 
52 Goodyear Tire, New, P205/75R15 (10/32) 5 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
53 Goodyear Tire, New, 205-75-15 Trailer 170 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
54 Goodyear Tire, New, 225/75R15 (11/32) 60 each NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
55 Goodyear Tire, New, ST225/75R15 Trailer 80 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 

56 Goodyear Tire, New, LT235/75R15 (12-32) 12 each NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
57 Goodyear Tire, New, LT235/85R16 (14/32) 100 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 

58 Goodyear Tire, New, LT215/85R16 (12/32) 400 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 

59 Goodyear Tire, New, 10R22.5 G G661 HAS 2,250 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID 

60 Goodyear Tire, New, 11 R22.5 G G661 HAS 3,850 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID 
61 Goodyear Tire, New, LT225/75R16E (13-32) 2,700 each NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
62 Goodyear Tire, New, P255-70R16 (12/32) 12 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID 
63 Goodyear Tire, New,275/70r-22.5 (275-80R) 22 each NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID 
64 Goodyear Tire, New, 245/65r17 50 each NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
65 Goodyear Tire, New, 225/70r-15 FD Ranger 65 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 

TOTAL-GOODYEAR NO BID NOBID 
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Bid No. 15·062R Bid Title: New Tires Bid Opened: October 2, 2014 

Purchasing Agent: Brian Long 

• 
THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA 

Earl W. Colvard, Inc. d/b/a Boulevard Tire Center, Deland, 
BID TABULATION SHEET Florida Callahan Tire, Riviera Beach, FL 

e>lu umt e>lu l'rice ,no l'rer. ner. nice i:,1aum1 .. ,u l'race ,no l'rer. Prer. Price 

Item A Description Quantity Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Price Extension Unit Price Extension 

66 Michelin Tire, New, 225llOR22.5 H G661 HSA 2,716 each $371.61 $ 1,009,292.76 NOBID NOBID 
67 Michelin Tire, New, 195llOR14 Conquest 5 each $85.83 $ 429.15 NOBID NOBID 
68 Michelin Tire, New, 195-65R15 12 each $90.87 $ 1,090.44 NOBID NOBID 
69 Michelin Tire, New, 225/50R17 Eagle RSA 96 each $128.39 $ 12,325.44 NOBID NOBID 
70 Michelin Tire, New, 215ll5R15P 3 each $99.56 $ 298.68 NOBID NOBID 
71 Michelin Tire, New, 27-950 X 15 Tractor 12 each *REMOVED * REMOVED NOBID NOBID 
72 Michelin Tire, New, 8-14.5 BIAS (11/321 70 each *REMOVED * REMOVED NOBID NOBID 
73 Michelin Tire, New, 225/60R·16 LOAD V 30 each $108.71 $ 3,261.30 NOBID NOBID 
74 Michelin Tire, New, 1000X20 BIAS-Trailers 8 each $0.00 *REMOVED NOBID NOBID 
75 Michelin Tire, New, P235-70R16 WAL SR-A 200 each $121.29 $ 24,258.00 NOBID NOBID 
76 Michelin Tire, New, P205ll5R14 (10/32) 12 each $76.55 $ 918.60 NOBID NOBID 
77 Michelin Tire, New, 8R19.5 (14/32) G647 500 each $264.46 $ 132,230.00 NOBID NOBID 
78 Michelin Tire, New, LT245ll5R16 (14/32) 800 each $161.61 $ 129,288.00 NOBID NOBID 
79 Michelin Tire, New, 215 SOR 16 Assurance 600 each $101.90 $ 61,140.00 NOBID NOBID 
80 Michelin Tire, New, 1000R15, Radial 16/32 12 each *REMOVED * REMOVED NOBID NOBID 
81 Michelin Tire, New, LT425ll5R-17E 325 each $161.61 $ 52,523.25 NOBID NOBID 
82 Michelin Tire, New, 245llOR 19.5 G159 20 each $270.69 $ 5,413.80 NOBID NOBID 
83 Michelin Tire, New, 235/55R17 Police 20 each $124.23 $ 2,484.60 NOBID NOBID 
84 Michelin Tire, New, P205ll5R15 (10/32) 5 each $75.39 $ 376.95 NOBID NOBID 
85 Michelin Tire, New, 205-75-15 Trailer 170 each * REMOVED *REMOVED NOBID NOBID 
86 Michelin Tire, New, 225ll5R15 (11/32) 60 each $113.50 $ 6,810.00 NOBID NOBID 
87 Michelin Tire, New, ST225ll5R15 Trailer 80 each * REMOVED *REMOVED NOBID NOBID 
88 Michelin Tire, New, LT235ll5R15 (12/32) 12 each $134.22 $ 1,610.64 NOBID NOBID 
89 Michelin Tire, New, LT235/85R16 (14/321 100 each $169.56 $ 16,956.00 NOBID NOBID 
90 Michelin Tire, New, LT215/85R16 (13/32) 400 each $168.10 $ 67,240.00 NOBID NOBID 
91 Michelin Tire, New, 10R22.5 G G661 HAS 2,250 each $354.28 $ 797,130.00 NOBID NOBID 
92 Michelin Tire, New, 11 R22.5 G G661 HAS 3,850 each $385.46 $ 1,484,021.00 NOBID NOBID 
93 Michelin Tire, New, LT225ll5R16E (13/32) 2,700 each $153.21 $ 413,667.00 NOBID NOBID 
94 Michelin Tire, New, P255-70R16 (12/32) 12 each $142.34 $ 1,708.08 NOBID NOBID 
95 Michelin Tire, New, 275llOR-22.5 (275/80Rl 22 each $392.98 $ 8,645.56 NOBID NOBID 

96 Michelin Tire, New, 245/65R17 50 each $138.42 $ 6,921.00 NOBID NOBID 

97 Michelin Tire, New, 225llOR-15 FD Ranger 65 each $96.61 $ 6,279.65 NOBID NOBID 

TOTAL· MICHELIN $ 4,246,319.90 NOBID 

98 Continenal Tire, New, 255llOR22.5 H G661HSA 2,716 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 

99 Continenal Tire, New,195llOR14 Conquest 5 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 

100 Contineoal Tire, New, 195-65R15 12 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 

101 Continenal Tire, New, 225/50R17 Eagle RSA 96 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 

102 Continenal Tire, New, 215ll5R15P 3 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 

103 Continenal Tire, New, 27-950 X 15 Tractor 12 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 

104 Continenal Tire, New, 8-14.5 BIAS (11/32) 70 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 

105 Continenal Tire, New, 225/SOR-16 LOAD V 30 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 

106 Continenal Tire, New, 1000X20 BIAS-Trailers 8 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 

Continenal Tire, New, P235-70R16 WAL SR-A 
107 OWL 200 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 

108 Continenal Tire, New, P205ll5R14 (10/32) 12 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
109 Continenal Tire, New,8R19.5 (14/32) G647 500 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
110 Continenal Tire, New, LT245ll5R16 (14/32) 800 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
111 Continenal Tire, New, 215 SOR 16 Assurance 600 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
112 ContinenalTire, New, 1000R15, Radial 16/32 12 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
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Bid No. 15-062R Bid Title: New Tires Bid Opened: October 2, 2014 

Purchasing Agent: Brian Long 

• 
THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA 

Earl W. Colvard, Inc. d/b/a Boulevard Tire Center, Deland, 
BID TABULATION SHEET Florida Callahan Tire, Riviera Beach FL 

Dia Unit Dia Price :>7o Pret. Pret. Price 1:11aUnit i:s1a Price :,v10 Pref. Pref. t'r1ce 
Item A Description Quantity Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Price Extension Unit Price Extension 

113 Continenal Tire, New, LT425/75R-17E 325 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
114 Continenal Tire, New,245/70R 19.5 G159 20 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
115 Continenal Tire, New, 8·14.5 BIAS (11/32) 20 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
116 Continenal Tire, New, P205/75R15 (10/32) 5 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
117 Continenal Tire, New, 205-75-15 Trailer 170 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
118 Continenal Tire, New, 225/75R15 (11/32) 60 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
119 Continenal Tire, New, ST225/75R15 Trailer 80 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
120 Continenal Tire, New,LT235/75R15 (12/32) 12 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
121 Continenal Tire, New, LT235/85R16114/32) 100 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
122 Continenal Tire, New, LT215/85R16 113/32) 400 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 

NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
123 Continenal Tire, New, 10R22.5 G G661 HAS 2,250 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
124 Continenal Tire, New, 11 R22.5 G G661 HAS 3,850 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
125 Continenal Tire, New, LT225/75R16E /13/32) 2,700 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
126 Continenal Tire, New, P255-70R16 (12/32) 12 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
127 Continenal Tire, New, 275/70R-22.5 1275-80R) 22 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
128 Continenal Tire, New, 245/65R17 50 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
129 Continenal Tire, New, 225/70R-15 FD Ranaer 65 each NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 

TOTAL· CONTINENTAL NOBID NOBID 

$ -

$ -

$ -

$ -

$ -

$ -

$ -

REMARKS: 
BID DRAFT WAS APPROVED BY: Brian Long, Purchasing Agent, 
BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY: Brian Long, Purchasing Agent 
RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDER(S) MEETING SPECIFICATIONS TERMS AND CONDITIONS. 
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Bid No. 15-062R Bid Title: New Tires Bid Opened: October 2, 2014 

Purchasing Agent: Brian Long 

• 
THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA 

BID TABULATION SHEET Tiresoles of Broward, Inc., Deerfield Beach, FL 
alu unn alu t'r1ce l:J7o t'rer. ner. t'r1ce alu umt alu t'r1ce l:J7o t'rer. ner. t'r1ce 

Item A Description Quantity Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Price Extension Unit Price Extension 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 255nOR22.5 H 
1 G661HSA 2,716 each NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 195nOR14 
2 Conquest 5 each NOBID NOBID 
3 Bridaestone/Firestone: Tire, New 195/65R15 12 each NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 225/50R17 
4 Eaale RSA 96 each NOBID NOBID 
5 Bridaestone/Firestone: Tire, New 215n5R15P 3 each .NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 27-950 X 15 
6 Tractor 12 each NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 8-14.5 BIAS 
7 (11/32) 70 each NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 225/60R-16 
8 LOADV 30 each NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 1000X20 BIAS-
9 Trailers 8 each. NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New P235-70R16 
10 WRL SR-A OWL 200 each NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New P205n5R14 
11 (10/32) 12 each NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 8R19.5 (14/32) 
12 G647 500 each NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New LT245n5R16 
13 i(14/32) WAL HT 800 each NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 215 60R 16 
14 Assurance 600 each NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 100R15, Radia; 
15 16/32 12 each NOBID NOBID 

16 Bridaestone/Firestone: Tire, New LT 425n5R-17E 325 each NOBID NOBID 
17 Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 245n 20 each NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, 235/55R17 
18 Police· 20 each NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, P205n5R15 
19 (10/32) 5 each NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, 205-75-15 -

20 Trailer 170 each NOBID NOBID 
Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, 225n5R15 

21 '11/32) 60 each NOBID NOBID 
Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, ST225n5R15 

22 Trailer 80 each NOBID NOBID 
Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, L T235n5R15 

23 1(12/32) 12 each NOBID NOBID 
Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, L T235/85R16 

24 (14/32) 100 each NOBID NOBID 
Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, LT215/85R16 

25 (13/32) 400 each NOBID NOBID 
Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, 10R22.5 G 

26 G661 HAS 2,250 each NOBID NOBID 
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Bid No. 15-062R Bid Title: New Tires Bid Opened: October 2, 2014 

Purchasing Agent: Brian Long 

0
THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA 

BID TABULATION SHEET Tiresoles of Broward, Inc., Deerfield Beach, FL 
i,10 unn <>lu l"r1ce ,no l"rer. ner. l"rice <>lu umt <>lu l"r1ce ;no l"rer. Prer. nice 

Item A Description Quantity Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Price Extension Unit Price Extension 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New 11 R22.5 G 
27 G661 HAS 3,850 each NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, LT225/75R16E 
28 '13/32) 2,700 each NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, P255-70R16 
29 ,(12/32) 12 each NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, 275/70R-22.5 
30 (275-80R) 22 each NOBID NOBID 

Bridgestone/Firestone: Tire, New, 225/70R-15 FD 
31 Ranaer 50 each NOBID NOBID 
32 Bridaestone/Firestone: Tire, New, 245/65R17 65 each NOBID NOBID 

TOTAL - BRIDGESTONE/FIRESTONE NOBID 

33 Goodyear Tire, New, 255/70R22.5 H G661HSA 2,716 each $301.56 $ 819,036.96 
34 Goodyear Tire, New, 195/70R14 ConQuest 5 each $61.44 $ 307.20 
35 GoodYear Tire, New, 195-65R 15 12 each $63.90 $ 766.80 
36 Goodyear Tire, New, 225/50R17 Eaale RSA 96 each $119.19 $ 11,442.24 
37 Goodyear Tire, New, 215/75R15P 3 each $62.50 $ 187.50 
38 Goodyear Tire, New, 27-950 X15 Tractor 12 each $239.62 $ 2,875.44 
39 Goodyear Tire, New, 8-14.5 BIAS (11/32) 70 each $123.46 $ 8,642.20 
40 Goodyear Tire, New, 225/60R-16 LOAD V 30 each $84.21 $ 2,526.30 
41 DELETE $ -

42 Goodyear Tire, New, 1000X20 BIAS-Trailers 8 each $237.00 $ 1,896.00 
Goodyear Tire, New, P235-70R16 WRL SR-A 

43 OWL 200 each $117.14 $ 23,428.00 
44 Goodyear Tire, New, P205/75R14 /10/321 12 each $72.76 $ 873.12 
45 Goodyear Tire, New, 8R19.5 (14-32) G647 500 each $251.67 $ 125,835.00 

Goodyear Tire, New, LT245/75R16 (14/32) WRI 
46 HT 800 each $133.30 $ 106,640.00 
47 Goodyear Tire, New, 215-60R 16 Assurance 600 each $70.00 $ 42,000.00 
48 Goodyear Tire, New, 1000R15, Radial 16/32 12 each $250.58 $ 3,006.96 
49 Goodyear Tire, New, LT425/75R-17E 325 each $156.28 $ 50,791.00 
50 Goodyear Tire, New, 245/70R 19.5 G159 20 each $337.47 $ 6,749.40 
51 Goodyear Tire, New, 235/55R17 Police 20 each $112.27 $ 2,245.40 
52 Goodyear Tire, New, P205/75R15 /10/321 5 each $62.50 $ 312.50 
53 Goodyear Tire, New, 205-75-15 Trailer 170 each $76.99 $ 13,088.30 
54 Goodyear Tire, New, 225/75R15 /11/32) 60 each $92.02 $ 5,521.20 
55 Goodyear Tire, New, ST225/75R15 Trailer 80 each $91.75 $ 7,340.00 

56 Goodyear Tire, New, LT235/75R15 (12-32) 12 each $123.13 $ 1,477.56 
57 Goodyear Tire, New, LT235/85R16 (14/32) 100 each $128.71 $ 12,871.00 
58 Goodyear Tire, New, LT215/85R16 /12/32) 400 each $132.25 $ 52,900.00 
59 Goodyear Tire, New, 10R22.5 G G661 HAS 2,250 each $322.12 $ 724,770.00 
60 Goodyear Tire, New, 11 R22.5 G G661 HAS 3,850 each $322.12 $ 1,240,162.00 
61 Goodyear Tire, New, L T225/75R16E (13-32) 2,700 each $122.50 $ 330,750.00 
62 Goodyear Tire, New, P255-70R16 (12/32) 12 each $118.96 $ 1,427.52 
63 Goodyear Tire, New,275/70r-22.5 (275-80R) 22 each $315.27 $ 6,935.94 
64 Goodyear Tire, New, 245/65r17 50 each $128.00 $ 6,400.00 
65 Goodyear Tire, New, 225/70r-15 FD Ranaer 65 each $92.50 $ 6,012.50 

TOTAL - GOODYEAR $ 3,619,218.04 
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Bid No. 15-062R Bid Title: New Tires Bid Opened: October 2, 2014 

Purchasing Agent: Brian Long 

0
THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA 

BID TABULATION SHEET Tiresoles of Broward, Inc., Deerfield Beach, FL 
CHU nit i:,10 l"rtce :)7o Pref. Pret. Price CIIQ Unit c,tu Price :no prer. ner. nice 

Item A Description Quantity Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Price Extension Unit Price Extension 

66 Michelin Tire, New, 225/70R22.5 H G661 HSA 2,716 each NOBID NOBID 

67 Michelin Tire, New, 195/70R14 Conauest 5 each NOBID NOBID 
68 Michelin Tire, New, 195-65R15 12 each NOBID NOBID 
69 Michelin Tire, New, 225/50R17 Eaale RSA 96 each NOBID NOBID 
70 Michelin Tire, New, 215/75R15P 3 each NOBID NOBID 
71 Michelin Tire, New, 27-950 X 15 Tractor 12 each NOBID NOBID 
72 Michelin Tire, New, 8-14.5 BIAS (11/32) 70 each NOBID NOBID 
73 Michelin Tire, New, 225/60R-16 LOAD V 30 each NOBID NOBID 
74 Michelin Tire, New, 1000X20 BIAS-Trailers 8 each NOBID NOBID 
75 Michelin Tire, New, P235-70R16 WRL SR-A 200 each NOBID NOBID 
76 Michelin Tire, New, P205/75R14 (10/32) 12 each NOBID NOBID 
77 Michelin Tire, New, 8R19.5 (14/32) G647 500 each NOBID NOBID 
78 Michelin Tire, New, LT245/75R16 (14/32) 800 each NOBID NOBID 
79 Michelin Tire, New, 215 60R 16 Assurance 600 each NOBID NOBID 
80 Michelin Tire, New, 1000R15, Radial 16/32 12 each NOBID NOBID 
81 Michelin Tire, New, LT425/75R-17E 325 each NOBID NOBID 
82 Michelin Tire, New, 245/70R 19.5 G159 20 each NOBID NOBID 
83 Michelin Tire, New, 235/55R17 Police 20 each NOBID NOBID 
84 Michelin Tire, New, P205/75R15 (10/32) 5 each NOBID NOBID 
85 Michelin Tire, New, 205-75-15 Trailer 170 each NOBID NOBID 
86 Michelin Tire, New, 225/75R15 (11/32) 60 each NOBID NOBID 
87 Michelin Tire, New, ST225/75R15 Trailer 80 each NOBID NOBID 
88 Michelin Tire, New, LT235/75R15 12/32 12 each NOBID NOBID 
89 Michelin Tire, New, LT235/85R16 14/32 100 each NOBID NOBID 
90 Michelin Tire, New, LT215/85R16 13/32 400 each NOBID NOBID 
91 Michelin Tire, New, 10R22.5 G G661 HAS 2,250 each NOBID NOBID 
92 Michelin Tire, New, 11 R22.5 G G661 HAS 3,850 each NOBID NOBID 
93 Michelin Tire, New, LT225/75R16E (13/32) 2,700 each NOBID NOBID 
94 Michelin Tire, New, P255-70R16 (12/32) 12 each NOBID NOBID 
95 Michelin Tire, New, 275/70R-22.5 (275/80R) 22 each NOBID NOBID 
96 Michelin Tire, New, 245/65R17 50 each NOBID NOBID 
97 Michelin Tire, New, 225/70R-15 FD Ranaer 65 each NOBID NOBID 

TOTAL - MICHELIN NOBID 

98 Continenal Tire, New, 255/70R22.5 H G661 HSA 2,716 each $288.00 $ 782,208.00 
99 Continenal Tire, New, 195/70R14 Conauest 5 each NOBID NOBID 
100 Continenal Tire, New, 195-65R15 12 each NOBID NOBID 
101 Continenal Tire, New, 225/50R17 Eaale RSA 96 each NOBID NOBID 

102 Continenal Tire, New, 215/75R15P 3 each NOBID NOBID 

103 Continenal Tire, New, 27-950 X 15 Tractor 12 each NOBID NOBID 

104 Continenal Tire, New, 8-14.5 BIAS (11/32) 70 each NOBID NOBID 

105 Continenal Tire, New, 225/60R-16 LOAD V 30 each NOBID NO BID 
106 Continenal Tire, New, 1000X20 BIAS-Trailers 8 each NOBID NOBID 

Continenal Tire, New, P235-70R16 WRL SR-A 
107 OWL 200 each NOBID NOBID 
108 Continenal Tire, New, P205/75R14 (10/32) 12 each NOBID NOBID 
109 Continenal Tire, New,8R19.5 (14/32) G647 500 each NOBID NOBID 
110 Continenal Tire, New, LT245/75R16 (14/32) 800 each NOBID NOBID 
111 Continenal Tire, New, 215 60R 16 Assurance 600 each NOBID NOBID 
112 Continenal Tire, New, 1000R15, Radial 16/32 12 each NOBID NOBID 
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Bid No. 15-062R Bid Title: New Tires Bid Opened: October 2, 2014 
Purchasing Agent: Brian Long 

1;, 
THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA

ti· BID TABULATION SHEET Tiresoles of Broward, Inc., Deerfield Beach, FL 
CIIU umt <>lu l"'r1ce �7o l"'re,. l"'re,. Price CHO umt Dia Price ::>7o Pret. Pret. Price 

Item A Description Quantity Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Price Extension Unit Price Extension 

113 Continenal Tire, New, LT425ll5R-17E 325 each NOBID NOBID 
114 Continenal Tire, New,245llOR 19.5 G159 20 each NOBID NOBID 
115 Continenal Tire, New, 8-14.5 BIAS (11/32) 20 each NOBID NOBID 
116 Continenal Tire, New, P205ll5R15 (10/32) 5 each NOBID NOBID 
117 Continenal Tire, New, 205-75-15 Trailer 170 each NOBID NOBID 
118 Continenal Tire, New, 225ll5R15 (11/32) 60 each NOBID NOBID 
119 Continenal Tire, New, ST225ll5R15 Trailer 80 each NOBID NOBID 
120 Continenal Tire, New,LT235ll5R15 (12/32) 12 each NOBID NOBID 
121 Continenal Tire, New, LT235/85R16 (14/32) 100 each NOBID NOBID 
122 Continenal Tire, New, LT215/85R16 (13/32} 400 each NOBID NOBID 
123 Continenal Tire, New, 10R22.5 G G661 HAS 2,250 each $310.00 $ 697,500.00 
124 Continenal Tire, New, 11 R22.5 G G661 HAS 3,850 each $353.45 $ 1,360,782.50 
125 Continenal Tire, New, LT225ll5R16E (13/32) 2,700 each NOBID NOBID 
126 Continenal Tire, New, P255-70R16 (12/32) 12 each NOBID NOBID 
127 Continenal Tire, New, 275llOR-22.5 (275-80R) 22 each $325.00 $ 7,150.00 
128 Continenal Tire, New, 245/65R17 50 each NOBID NOBID 
129 Continenal Tire, New, 225llOR-15 FD Ranger 65 each NOBID NOBID 

TOTAL: CONTINENTAL INCOMPLETE 

REMARKS: 
BID DRAFT WAS APPROVED BY: Brian Long, Purchasing Agent; Pat Snell, Student Transportation & Fleet Services; Tony Welsh, Jeffery Wentworth, Benno Auerbach-Vehicle Maintenance 
BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY: Brian Long, Purchasing Agent; Tony Welsh, Vehicle Maintenance 
RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDER(S) MEETING SPECIFICATIONS TERMS AND CONDITIONS. 
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